Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1442509
Vendor Name: Yankee Book Peddler, Inc

Check Detalils:

Check Number: E0107902
Check Amount: $ 537.07
Check Date: 6/3/2025

Invoice Details:

Invoice Number: 405355
Invoice Date: 5/7/2025

PO Number: B0002345
Voucher Number: V0886831

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below



®
RETURN BOOKS ONLY TO: G,O B E . .\ . Please refer to invoice number
YBP Library Services " Lfbmry Salutmns fﬂ}m EBSCG below when writing or remitting.
A service of YBP, Inc. FEIN 02-0302143 INVOICE

999 Maple St. Remit
emit to: PO Box 277991 Atlanta, GA 30384-7991 USA

Contoocook, NH 03229
PHONE: AR: +1 (205) 981-5111 Customer Service: 603 746-3102 800 258-3774
1% Finance Charge per 30 days past due

PAGE
SOLD COLLEGE OF DUPAGE SHIP COLLEGE OF DUPAGE 1
TO: LIBRARY SCR 2034 TO: LIBRARY SCR 2034
PRINT ACQUISITIONS Attn: LARISA L. MILLER
425 FAWELL BOULEVARD 5127/25 BO # 2345 425 FAWELL BLVD
GLEN ELLYN, IL 60137 6599 GLEN ELLYN, IL 60137-6599
INVOICE DATE TERMS DUE DATE CUSTOMER ORDER NUMBER CUSTOMER NUMBER
5/07/25 net 30 6/06/25 RUSH DROPSHIP 1256-02
QUANTITY PURCHASE ORDER # AUTHOR ISBN | | VOL # LIST PRICE | DlSCOUNT| SINGLE NET NET AMOUNT
1 SOPHOKLES 155481586X PA 17.95 0% 17.95 17.95

ANTIGONE; ED. BY J. AULTMAN-MOORRE.

* K K K KX K* KX Kk X X Xk K* Kk * X X * K* * * * * K* * * * * K* Kx *

Rush Shipment
Books Shipped Separately
* Kk Kk Kk KX Kk Kk KX Kk Kk Kk Kk Kk Kk Kk KX Kk kX K* Kk Kk K* Kk X Kx X K* * X X
YBP is pleased to offer the option to receive this
invoice by email. Print books will still ship with
a hardcopy invoice. Please contact your Customer
Service Bibliographer for more information.

* Service fee added,short or no discount  Qriginal
from publisher




®
RETURN BOOKS ONLY TO: G,O B E . .\ . Please refer to invoice number
" Lfbmry Solutions from EBSCO below when writing or remitting.

YBP Library Services

999 Maple St. Rermi A service of YBP, Inc. FEIN 02-0302143 INVOICE
Contoocook, NH 03229 emit to: PO Box 277991 Atlanta, GA 303§4-7991 USA NUMBER 405355
PHONE: AR: +1 (205) 981-5111 Customer Service: 603 746-3102 800 258-3774
1% Finance Charge per 30 days past due
PAGE 2
SOLD COLLEGE OF DUPAGE SHIP COLLEGE OF DUPAGE
TO: LIBRARY SCR 2034 TO: LIBRARY SCR 2034
PRINT ACQUISITIONS Attn: LARISA L. MILLER
425 FAWELL BOULEVARD 425 FAWELL BLVD
GLEN ELLYN, IL 60137 6599 GLEN ELLYN, IL 60137-6599
INVOICE DATE TERMS DUE DATE CUSTOMER ORDER NUMBER CUSTOMER NUMBER
5/07/25 net 30 6/06/25 RUSH DROPSHIP 1256-02
QUANTITY PURCHASE ORDER # AUTHOR ISBN | | VOL # LIST PRICE | DISCOUNT| SINGLE NET NET AMOUNT
* kX * kKX E * kKX *k*k E *kk *kx E *k*k *kk E * kX *xx
Fhx Container IDs in this shipment Fokx
*kk *kx
Fkx 484593513 Fekk
*kk *kxx
*kk * kKX E *kk *k*k E * kX E = E *k*k *kk E * kX *kx
1 * Service fee added,short or no discount Original 11-92 Sub Total 17.95

TOTQTY  from publisher Freight Surcharge .00 GST/Tax .00 Total US$ 17.95



From: Brady, Scott

To: Mclntosh, Jennifer
Cc: Hunnicutt, Marianne; Stock, Lisa
Subject: RE: Vendor Invoicing Procedures
Date: Thursday, January 7, 2021 2:57:04 PM
Attachments: image001.png

image002.png

Hello Jennifer,

First off | do appreciate the time and thought you put into your email. I've added your concerns to a
discussion we will be having with the Provost and Lisa Stock tomorrow afternoon. | the meantime, if
you have invoices which are coming due, please send them onto Accounts Payable and let them
know | approved them to come in that way while we work this all out. Thanks, Scott

Scott L. Brady, CPA

Interim Chief Financial Officer
College of DuPage

425 Fawell Blvd.

SRC 2130L

Glen Ellyn, IL 60137-6599
Direct: 630.942.2219

Email: bradys310@cod.edu

(@ College of DuPage

Disclosure Statement:

Information in this transmission is intended only for the person(s) to whom it is addressed and may contain
privileged and/or confidential information. If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying or
dissemination of the information is unauthorized and you should delete/destroy all copies and notify the sender.
No liability is accepted for any unauthorized use of the information contained in this transmission.

From: MclIntosh, Jennifer <mcintoshjl144@cod.edu>

Sent: Thursday, January 7, 2021 10:41 AM

To: Brady, Scott <bradys310@cod.edu>

Cc: Hunnicutt, Marianne <hunnicut@cod.edu>; Stock, Lisa <stockl@cod.edu>
Subject: RE: Vendor Invoicing Procedures

Hi Scott,
Happy New Year—hope you had a restorative break.

I’'m working through the implications of the procedural change you announced just before break
with the Library acquisitions team. As procurement is an embedded, core function of the Library
(ordering, receiving, and creating a controlled inventory of physical and virtual items), having
vendors submit invoices to AP directly without our acquisitions team receiving/reviewing them first
creates a number of problems. I’'m hoping you may consider making an exception to this policy for



"Miller, Larisa" <millerl@cod.edu>

BO # 2345 Y ankee Book Peddler | nvoice 405355

"Miller, Larisa" <millerl@cod.edu> Tue, May 27, 2025 at 02:53 PM UTC
CC:
BCC:

BO # 2345 Yankee Book Peddler Invoice 405355

Larisa Miller

College of DuPage Library

Supervisor Acquisitions

425 Fawell Blvd.

SRC 2034

Glen Ellyn, IL 60137

630.942.3664 (V)

millerl@cod.edu

1 attachment

ybp invoice 405355.pdf



Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1442509
Vendor Name: Yankee Book Peddler, Inc

Check Detalils:

Check Number: E0107902
Check Amount: $ 537.07
Check Date: 6/3/2025

Invoice Details:

Invoice Number: 410983
Invoice Date: 5/13/2025
PO Number: B0002345
Voucher Number: V0886832

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below



®
RETURN BOOKS ONLY TO: G,O B E . .\ . Please refer to invoice number
" Lfbmry Solutions from EBSCO below when writing or remitting.

YBP Library Services

999 Maple St. . A.sen/ice of YBP, Inc. FEIN 02-0302143 INVOICE
Contoocook, NH 03229 Remit to: PO Box 277991 Atlanta, GA 303?4-7991 USA NUMBER 410983
PHONE: AR: +1 (205) 981-5111 Customer Service: 603 746-3102 800 258-3774
1% Finance Charge per 30 days past due
PAGE 1
SOLD COLLEGE OF DUPAGE SHIP COLLEGE OF DUPAGE
TO: LIBRARY SCR 2034 TO: LIBRARY SCR 2034
PRINT ACQUISITIONS Attn: LARISA L. MILLER
425 FAWELL BOULEVARD 5/27/25 BO # 2345 425 FAWELL BLVD
GLEN ELLYN, IL 60137 6599 GLEN ELLYN, IL 60137-6599
INVOICE DATE TERMS DUE DATE CUSTOMER ORDER NUMBER CUSTOMER NUMBER
5/13/25 net 30 6/12/25 RUSH DROPSHIP 1256-02
QUANTITY PURCHASE ORDER # AUTHOR ISBN | | VOL # | LIST PRICE | DISCOUNT| SINGLE NET NET AMOUNT
1 FABRITIUS 1538159538 HF 26.00 10.0% 23.40 23.40
BRAIN-FRIENDLY WORKPLACE: WHY TALENTED PEOPLE
1 WILLIAMS, 0197567223 HQ 29.95 10.0% 26.96 26.96

MARGINALIZED, MOBILIZED, INCORPORATED: WOMEN A

* K Kk K KX K* KX Kk X Xk Kk K* Kx * X X * K* * * * * K* * * * * K* K *

Rush Shipment
Books Shipped Separately
* K* K Kk KX Kk Kk KX Kk Kk Kk Kk Kk Kk Kk K* Kk Kk K* K Kk K* Kk X K* X K* *x X X
YBP is pleased to offer the option to receive this
invoice by email. Print books will still ship with
a hardcopy invoice. Please contact your Customer
Service Bibliographer for more information.

* Service fee added,short or no discount  Qriginal
from publisher




®
RETURN BOOKS ONLY TO: G,O B E . .\ . Please refer to invoice number
" Lfbmry Solutions from EBSCO below when writing or remitting.

YBP Library Services

999 Maple St. Rermi A service of YBP, Inc. FEIN 02-0302143 INVOICE
Contoocook, NH 03229 emit to: PO Box 277991 Atlanta, GA 303§4-7991 USA NUMBER 410983
PHONE: AR: +1 (205) 981-5111 Customer Service: 603 746-3102 800 258-3774
1% Finance Charge per 30 days past due
PAGE 2
SOLD COLLEGE OF DUPAGE SHIP COLLEGE OF DUPAGE
TO: LIBRARY SCR 2034 TO: LIBRARY SCR 2034
PRINT ACQUISITIONS Attn: LARISA L. MILLER
425 FAWELL BOULEVARD 425 FAWELL BLVD
GLEN ELLYN, IL 60137 6599 GLEN ELLYN, IL 60137-6599
INVOICE DATE TERMS DUE DATE CUSTOMER ORDER NUMBER CUSTOMER NUMBER
5/13/25 net 30 6/12/25 RUSH DROPSHIP 1256-02
QUANTITY PURCHASE ORDER # AUTHOR ISBN | | VOL # LIST PRICE | DISCOUNT| SINGLE NET NET AMOUNT
* kX * kKX E * kKX *k*k E *kk *kx E *k*k *kk E * kX *xx
Fhx Container IDs in this shipment Fokx
*kk *kx
Fkx 000000201 Fekk
*kk *kxx
*kk * kKX E *kk *k*k E * kX E = E *k*k *kk E * kX *kx
2 * Service fee added,short or no discount Original 57-73 Sub Total 50.36

TOTQTY  from publisher Freight Surcharge .00 GST/Tax .00 Total US$ 50.36



From: Brady, Scott

To: Mclntosh, Jennifer
Cc: Hunnicutt, Marianne; Stock, Lisa
Subject: RE: Vendor Invoicing Procedures
Date: Thursday, January 7, 2021 2:57:04 PM
Attachments: image001.png

image002.png

Hello Jennifer,

First off | do appreciate the time and thought you put into your email. I've added your concerns to a
discussion we will be having with the Provost and Lisa Stock tomorrow afternoon. | the meantime, if
you have invoices which are coming due, please send them onto Accounts Payable and let them
know | approved them to come in that way while we work this all out. Thanks, Scott

Scott L. Brady, CPA

Interim Chief Financial Officer
College of DuPage

425 Fawell Blvd.

SRC 2130L

Glen Ellyn, IL 60137-6599
Direct: 630.942.2219

Email: bradys310@cod.edu

(@ College of DuPage

Disclosure Statement:

Information in this transmission is intended only for the person(s) to whom it is addressed and may contain
privileged and/or confidential information. If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying or
dissemination of the information is unauthorized and you should delete/destroy all copies and notify the sender.
No liability is accepted for any unauthorized use of the information contained in this transmission.

From: MclIntosh, Jennifer <mcintoshjl144@cod.edu>

Sent: Thursday, January 7, 2021 10:41 AM

To: Brady, Scott <bradys310@cod.edu>

Cc: Hunnicutt, Marianne <hunnicut@cod.edu>; Stock, Lisa <stockl@cod.edu>
Subject: RE: Vendor Invoicing Procedures

Hi Scott,
Happy New Year—hope you had a restorative break.

I’'m working through the implications of the procedural change you announced just before break
with the Library acquisitions team. As procurement is an embedded, core function of the Library
(ordering, receiving, and creating a controlled inventory of physical and virtual items), having
vendors submit invoices to AP directly without our acquisitions team receiving/reviewing them first
creates a number of problems. I’'m hoping you may consider making an exception to this policy for



"Miller, Larisa" <millerl@cod.edu>

BO # 2345 Y ankee Book Peddler | nvoice 410983

"Miller, Larisa" <millerl@cod.edu> Tue, May 27, 2025 at 02:53 PM UTC
CC:
BCC:

BO # 2345 Yankee Book Peddler Invoice 410983

Larisa Miller

College of DuPage Library

Supervisor Acquisitions

425 Fawell Blvd.

SRC 2034

Glen Ellyn, IL 60137

630.942.3664 (V)

millerl@cod.edu

1 attachment

ybp invoice 410983.pdf



Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1442509
Vendor Name: Yankee Book Peddler, Inc

Check Detalils:

Check Number: E0107902
Check Amount: $ 537.07
Check Date: 6/3/2025

Invoice Details:

Invoice Number: 411887
Invoice Date: 5/14/2025
PO Number: B0002345
Voucher Number: V0886833

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below



RETURN BOOKS ONLY TO:
YBP Library Services

A service of YBP, Inc. FEIN 02-0302143

GO B E”” Library Solutions from EBSCO

Please refer to invoice number

below when writing or remitting.

999 Maple St. o INVOICE
Contoocook, NH 03229 Remit to: PO Box 277991 Atlanta, GA 303&}4-7991 USA NUMBER 411887
PHONE: AR: +1 (205) 981-5111 Customer Service: 603 746-3102 800 258-3774
1% Finance Charge per 30 days past due
PAGE 1
SOLD COLLEGE OF DUPAGE SHIP COLLEGE OF DUPAGE
TO: SRC 2034 LIBRARY TO: ATTN: LIBRARY
425 FAWELL BOULEVARD 425 FAWELL BLVD
GLEN ELLYN, IL 60137-6599 GLEN ELLYN, IL 60137-6599
5/27/25 BO # 2345
INVOICE DATE TERMS DUE DATE CUSTOMER ORDER NUMBER CUSTOMER NUMBER
5/14/25 net 30 6/13/25 FIRM ORDER 1256-10
QUANTITY PURCHASE ORDER # AUTHOR ISBN | | VOL # LIST PRICE | DISCOUNT| SINGLE NET NET AMOUNT
1 JOHNSON, 9781032752471 PE 54.99 19.0% 44 .54 44 .54
CRITICAL THINKING FOR ENGLISH-LANGUAGE LEARNER
1 WINTERBOT 9781138932296 NA 55.99 19.0% 45_.35 45_.35
DESIGN-BUILD: INTEGRATING CRAFT, SERVICE, AND
1 LAMBIRTH, 9781848226968 ORENIC ND 59.99 19.0% 48.59 48.59
HELEN CLAPCOTT: IN THE LIGHT OF BUILDINGS.
1 LEITER, B 9781138938519 B 34.99 19.0% 28.34 28.34
MARX .
1 9781800505254 BL 29.95 19.0% 24.26 24 .26
PAGAN RELIGIONS IN FIVE MINUTES; ED. BY SUZANN
1 FRASER, A 9781039193055 56.49 19.0% 45.76 45.76
TOUCH AFTER TRAUMA: A PRACTICAL GUIDE FOR MANU
1 9781975209216 RD 59.99 -0% 59.99 59.99
WOUND CARE MADE INCREDIBLY EASY!; ED. BY PATRI
*kk * kKX E *kk *kx E * kX *kk E *kk E = E * kKX E =
Fhx Container IDs in this shipment Fkx
E = E =
ek 000005257720 Fekx
*kk *kx
E = * kKX E kX *kx E * kX E = E *kk E = E * kKX E =
7 * Service fee added,short or no discount Original 25-64 Sub Total 296.83
TOTQTY from publisher Freight Surcharge 4.45 GST/Tax .00 Total US$ 301.28



From: Brady, Scott

To: Mclntosh, Jennifer
Cc: Hunnicutt, Marianne; Stock, Lisa
Subject: RE: Vendor Invoicing Procedures
Date: Thursday, January 7, 2021 2:57:04 PM
Attachments: image001.png

image002.png

Hello Jennifer,

First off | do appreciate the time and thought you put into your email. I've added your concerns to a
discussion we will be having with the Provost and Lisa Stock tomorrow afternoon. | the meantime, if
you have invoices which are coming due, please send them onto Accounts Payable and let them
know | approved them to come in that way while we work this all out. Thanks, Scott

Scott L. Brady, CPA

Interim Chief Financial Officer
College of DuPage

425 Fawell Blvd.

SRC 2130L

Glen Ellyn, IL 60137-6599
Direct: 630.942.2219

Email: bradys310@cod.edu

(@ College of DuPage

Disclosure Statement:

Information in this transmission is intended only for the person(s) to whom it is addressed and may contain
privileged and/or confidential information. If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying or
dissemination of the information is unauthorized and you should delete/destroy all copies and notify the sender.
No liability is accepted for any unauthorized use of the information contained in this transmission.

From: MclIntosh, Jennifer <mcintoshjl144@cod.edu>

Sent: Thursday, January 7, 2021 10:41 AM

To: Brady, Scott <bradys310@cod.edu>

Cc: Hunnicutt, Marianne <hunnicut@cod.edu>; Stock, Lisa <stockl@cod.edu>
Subject: RE: Vendor Invoicing Procedures

Hi Scott,
Happy New Year—hope you had a restorative break.

I’'m working through the implications of the procedural change you announced just before break
with the Library acquisitions team. As procurement is an embedded, core function of the Library
(ordering, receiving, and creating a controlled inventory of physical and virtual items), having
vendors submit invoices to AP directly without our acquisitions team receiving/reviewing them first
creates a number of problems. I’'m hoping you may consider making an exception to this policy for



"Miller, Larisa" <millerl@cod.edu>

BO # 2345 Y ankee Book Peddler | nvoice 411887

"Miller, Larisa" <millerl@cod.edu> Tue, May 27, 2025 at 02:54 PM UTC
CC:
BCC:

BO # 2345 Yankee Book Peddler Invoice 411887

Larisa Miller

College of DuPage Library

Supervisor Acquisitions

425 Fawell Blvd.

SRC 2034

Glen Ellyn, IL 60137

630.942.3664 (V)

millerl@cod.edu

1 attachment

ybp invoice 411887.pdf



Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1442509
Vendor Name: Yankee Book Peddler, Inc

Check Detalils:

Check Number: E0107902
Check Amount: $ 537.07
Check Date: 6/3/2025

Invoice Details:

Invoice Number: 414995
Invoice Date: 5/16/2025
PO Number: B0002345
Voucher Number: V0886834

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below



RETURN BOOKS ONLY TO:
YBP Library Services

A service of YBP, Inc. FEIN 02-0302143

GO B E”” Library Solutions from EBSCO

Please refer to invoice number

below when writing or remitting.

999 Maple St. o INVOICE
Contoocook, NH 03229 Remit to: PO Box 277991 Atlanta, GA 303§4-7991 USA NUMBER 414995
PHONE: AR: +1(205) 981-5111 Customer Service: 603 746-3102 800 258-3774
1% Finance Charge per 30 days past due
PAGE 1
SOLD COLLEGE OF DUPAGE SHIP COLLEGE OF DUPAGE
TO: SRC 2034 LIBRARY TO: ATTN: LIBRARY
425 FAWELL BOULEVARD 425 FAWELL BLVD
GLEN ELLYN, IL 60137-6599 GLEN ELLYN, IL 60137-6599
5/27/25 BO # 2345
INVOICE DATE TERMS DUE DATE CUSTOMER ORDER NUMBER CUSTOMER NUMBER
5/16/25 net 30 6/15/25 FIRM ORDER 1256-10
QUANTITY|  PURCHASE ORDER # AUTHOR ISBN | | VOL # LIST PRICE | DISCOUNT| SINGLE NET | NET AMOUNT
1 9781035328567 HD 165.00 -0% 165.00 165.00
CASE STUDIES ON NONPROFIT RESILIENCE MANAGEMEN
E = * kKX E *k*k *k*k E *kk *xx E *kxk E = E * kX *xk
falaied Container IDs in this shipment olalel
E = *kx
okl 000005259053 alaiel
*kk *kx
E = *k*k E *kk *k*k E *kk *kxk E *kk E = E * kKX E =
1 * Service fee added,short or no discount Original 80-08 Sub Total 165.00
TOTQTY  from publisher Freight Surcharge 2.48 GST/Tax .00 Total US$ 167.48



From: Brady, Scott

To: Mclntosh, Jennifer
Cc: Hunnicutt, Marianne; Stock, Lisa
Subject: RE: Vendor Invoicing Procedures
Date: Thursday, January 7, 2021 2:57:04 PM
Attachments: image001.png

image002.png

Hello Jennifer,

First off | do appreciate the time and thought you put into your email. I've added your concerns to a
discussion we will be having with the Provost and Lisa Stock tomorrow afternoon. | the meantime, if
you have invoices which are coming due, please send them onto Accounts Payable and let them
know | approved them to come in that way while we work this all out. Thanks, Scott

Scott L. Brady, CPA

Interim Chief Financial Officer
College of DuPage

425 Fawell Blvd.

SRC 2130L

Glen Ellyn, IL 60137-6599
Direct: 630.942.2219

Email: bradys310@cod.edu

(@ College of DuPage

Disclosure Statement:

Information in this transmission is intended only for the person(s) to whom it is addressed and may contain
privileged and/or confidential information. If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying or
dissemination of the information is unauthorized and you should delete/destroy all copies and notify the sender.
No liability is accepted for any unauthorized use of the information contained in this transmission.

From: MclIntosh, Jennifer <mcintoshjl144@cod.edu>

Sent: Thursday, January 7, 2021 10:41 AM

To: Brady, Scott <bradys310@cod.edu>

Cc: Hunnicutt, Marianne <hunnicut@cod.edu>; Stock, Lisa <stockl@cod.edu>
Subject: RE: Vendor Invoicing Procedures

Hi Scott,
Happy New Year—hope you had a restorative break.

I’'m working through the implications of the procedural change you announced just before break
with the Library acquisitions team. As procurement is an embedded, core function of the Library
(ordering, receiving, and creating a controlled inventory of physical and virtual items), having
vendors submit invoices to AP directly without our acquisitions team receiving/reviewing them first
creates a number of problems. I’'m hoping you may consider making an exception to this policy for



"Miller, Larisa" <millerl@cod.edu>

BO # 2345 Y ankee Book Peddler | nvoice 414995

"Miller, Larisa" <millerl@cod.edu> Tue, May 27, 2025 at 02:54 PM UTC
CC:
BCC:

BO # 2345 Yankee Book Peddler Invoice 414995

Larisa Miller

College of DuPage Library

Supervisor Acquisitions

425 Fawell Blvd.

SRC 2034

Glen Ellyn, IL 60137

630.942.3664 (V)

millerl@cod.edu

1 attachment

ybp invoice 414995.pdf
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